
Welcome to EDePro!

Learning and innovation-based culture to meet tomorrow’s challenges

I would like to personally welcome you to EDePro corporate website, the home of Eastern European leaders 
in cutting-edge defense and security solutions. With over thirty-year long tradition, from a university-based 
laboratory, our company has undergone a remarkable evolution and exciting journey, pioneering advances in 
scientific research, innovation, and technological ingenuity, as we’ve pursued our vision to become the 
synonym for groundbreaking technologies in defense and related industries.  





Today, EDePro is recognized as a globally renowned company, and - one of the key engineering hubs for 
research, development, production, trade, and modernization of the rocket systems, artillery munitions, and 
defense equipment in this part of the world. 





Fostering an environment of technological empowerment, our outcomes power answering the most 
important today's and tomorrow’s defense challenges in an ever-changing world. Driven by this purpose 
since the establishment of the company, we are delivering premium quality, innovative, cost-effective 
solutions, products, and services for our worldwide client base. 




On the track of the fourth industrial revolution that we are witnessing, at EDePro we believe that the 
development of societies lies in tech intensity, scientific discovery, knowledge, and skills that foster 
innovation, reducing differences defined by previous industrial revolutions, and thus economic development. 
Knowledge-based economy and coping with the change of pace of high-tech globalization have become the 
most significant elements of societal progress nowadays. 





As a company with far-reaching implications for the economy, we remain focused on strong contribution to 
the industrial development and competitiveness of Serbia on the global scale, which is why our strategic 
path includes constant and strong support to education and science development. By sharing our extensive 
knowledge in academia and research centers, we strive to contribute to creating generations of top-class 
engineers equipped with skills to respond to 21st-century challenges. It is only through close cooperation of 
industry and education that we can reach excellence in both fields and find our place on the world’s 
industrial and technological map.





Accordingly, within EDePro today we are committed to learning-based culture and operations, where our 
people have been and always will be our greatest asset that enables us to reshape our industry and make our 
company even better, year after year.  Our ambitious vision for the company’s future lies in our capability to 
transform, extend our already strong results, and detect new opportunities where our performance can find 
improvement, while constantly adapting to meet the changing needs of clients and society as a whole.





We have achieved a lot over the past decades and I strongly believe that for EDePro the future holds even 
more – to lead the industry technological trends of tomorrow, sustainable growth, safety, and progress of our 
customers, our employees, partners, institutions, and communities.


Sincerely,



Branislav Jojic, Founder and ceo of EDePro company



 A Word from 


our FOUNDER


